
ARRANGEMENT
1. The Division Bench presided over by Hon'ble Mr. Justice Anjani Kumar Mishra (Court No.46) in addition to its

own  determination,  will  take  up  the  fresh  cases  from  serial  nos.1  to  102,  Applications  and  remaining
determination (except the Additional/Unlisted cases from serial nos.3001 to 3133) of Court No.43 (The Division
Bench presided over by Hon'ble Mr. Justice V. K. Birla), on 09.02.2023.

2. The Division Bench presided over by Hon'ble Mr. Justice Suneet Kumar (Court No.42) in addition to its own
determination  is  assigned the  fresh cases  from serial  nos.139 to 188 of  Court  No.3  (The  Division  Bench
presided over by Hon'ble Mr. Justice S. P. Kesarwani), on 09.02.2023.

3. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Rajiv Joshi (Court No.30) in addition to his own determination is assigned the fresh cases
from serial nos.324 to 423 of Court No.7 (Hon’ble Mr. Justice Chandra Kumar Rai), on 09.02.2023.

4. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Salil Kumar Rai (Court No.38) in addition to his own determination, will take up the fresh
cases from serial nos.1 to 23, Applications and remaining determination (except the Additional/ Unlisted cases
from serial nos.3001 to 3312) of Court No.18 (Hon'ble Mr. Justice Ashutosh Srivastava), on 09.02.2023.

5. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Rajiv Gupta (Court No.65) in addition to his own determination is assigned the fresh cases
from serial nos.309 to 358 of Court No.67 (Hon’ble Mr. Justice Rahul Chaturvedi), on 09.02.2023.

6. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Dinesh Kumar Singh (Court No.87) in addition to his own determination, will take up the
fresh  cases  from serial  nos.1  to  100  of  Court  No.80  (Hon’ble  Mr.  Justice  Subhash Chandra  Sharma),  on
09.02.2023. 

7. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Ajay Bhanot (Court No.74) in addition to his own determination, will take up the fresh cases
from serial nos.101 to 200 of Court No.80 (Hon’ble Mr. Justice Subhash Chandra Sharma), on 09.02.2023. 

8. Hon'ble Mrs. Justice Manju Rani Chauhan (Court No.77) in addition to her own determination, will take up the
fresh cases from serial  nos.201 to 300 of Court No.80 (Hon’ble Mr. Justice Subhash Chandra Sharma), on
09.02.2023. 

9. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Krishan Pahal (Court No.83) in addition to his own determination, will take up the fresh
cases from serial nos.301 to 400, the Additional/Unlisted cases from serial nos.3001 to 3011, Applications and
remaining determination of Court No.80 (Hon’ble Mr. Justice Subhash Chandra Sharma), on 09.02.2023. 

10. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Saurabh Srivastava (Court No.19) in addition to his own determination is assigned the fresh
cases from serial nos.424 to 523 of Court No.7 (Hon’ble Mr. Justice Chandra Kumar Rai), on 09.02.2023.

11. Hon'ble Ms. Justice Nand Prabha Shukla will sit singly in Court No.22 at 3.00 P.M. till the formation of Regular
Division Bench in Court No.39 and will take up the fresh cases from serial nos.154 to 188 of Court No.78
(Hon'ble Mr. Justice Deepak Verma), on 09.02.2023.

12. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Kshitij Shailendra will sit singly in Court No.43 and will take up the fresh cases from serial
nos.524 to 623 of Court No.7 (Hon'ble Mr. Justice Chandra Kumar Rai), on 09.02.2023.

13. Hon'ble Mr. Justice Vinod Diwakar will sit singly in Court No.23 at 3.00 P.M. till the formation of Regular Division
Bench in Court No.47 and will take up the fresh cases from serial nos.189 to 213 of Court No.78 (Hon'ble Mr.
Justice Deepak Verma), on 09.02.2023.

Note:-
            1.   The Additional/Unlisted cases from serial nos.3001 to 3133 of Court No.43 (The Division Bench 
       presided over by Hon'ble Mr. Justice V. K. Birla) on 09.02.2023 shall be rotated for 16.02.2023.
            2.   The Additional/Unlisted cases from serial nos.3001 to 3312 of Court No.18 (Hon'ble Mr. Justice 
        Ashutosh Srivastava) on 09.02.2023 shall be rotated for 16.02.2023.

               3.   The matters transferred or assigned in this order are except TU/PH.
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